Reg. Mtg. Pg. 1

MONTECITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Agenda for the Regular Meeting of the Board of Directors

Montecito Fire Protection District Headquarters
595 San Ysidro Road
Santa Barbara, California

October 24, 2022 at 2:00 p.m.

Agenda Items May Be Taken Out of the Order Shown

1. Publiccomment: Any person may address the Board at this time on any non-agenda
matter that is within the subject matter jurisdiction of the Montecito Fire Protection
District. (30 minutes total time allotted for this discussion.)

2. That the Board of Directors adopt Resolution 2022-17, approving the Montecito
Vegetation Management Program and finding the program is within the scope of the
California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection Vegetation Treatment Program
Environmental Impact Report and that no further CEQA document is required. Click here
for report Presentation by Dudek representative, Dana Link-Herrera. (Strategic Plan Goal
2)

a. Staff report presented by Fire Marshal Briner.

3. Approve the first reading by title only of Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Montecito Fire
Protection District adopting the 2022 California Fire Code and the Montecito Fire
Protection District Development Standards, amending provisions of the 2022 California
Fire Code, amending provisions of the 2022 California Residential Code, amending
provisions of the 2022 California Building Code and scheduling a public hearing on
November 28, 2022, for the subsequent adoption of the ordinance. (Strategic Plan Goal 1
and 2)

a. Staff report presented by Fire Marshal Briner.
4. Approval of Minutes of the September 26, 2022 Regular Meeting.
5. Approval of Minutes of the October 3, 2022 Special Meeting.
6. Fire Chief’s report.

7. Board of Director’s report.

October 24, 2022


https://s3.amazonaws.com/siteninja/multitenant/assets/32979/files/original/MontecitoVMP.pdf
https://s3.amazonaws.com/siteninja/multitenant/assets/32979/files/original/MontecitoVMP.pdf

Reg. Mtg. Pg. 2
Montecito Fire Protection District
Agenda for Regular Meeting, October 24, 2022
Page 2

8. Suggestions from Directors for items other than regular agenda items to be included for
the November 28, 2022 Regular Board meeting.

Adjournment

This agenda posted pursuant to the provisions of the Government Code commencing at Section
54950. The date of the posting is October 20, 2022.

LN

Kevin Taylor, Fire Chief

Note: In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, if you need special assistance to participate in this meeting, please contact the District office at
969-7762. Notification at least 48 hours prior to the meeting will enable the District to make reasonable arrangements.

Materials related to an item on this agenda submitted to the Board of Directors after distribution of the agenda packet are available for public
inspection in the Montecito Fire Protection District’s office located at 595 San Ysidro Road during normal business hours.

October 24, 2022



Agenda
Item #2

22222222222222



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 4

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 5

STAFF REPORT

To: Montecito Fire Protection District Board of Directors

From: Kevin Taylor, Fire Chief <~

Prepared By: Aaron Briner, Fire Marshal

Date: October 24, 2022

Topic: Vegetation Management Program — Project Specific Analysis
Summary

The Montecito Fire Protection District (MFPD) wishes to enhance community preparedness and increase
landscape resilience by expanding treatment areas within the Vegetation Management Program. MFPD
hired the environmental consultant, Dudek, to complete an environmental review and ensure compliance
of the California Environment Quality Act (CEQA) during project implementation.

Discussion

Since 1994, MFPD has assembled a range of programs that facilitate wildfire preparedness and mitigation.
The Vegetation Management Program is composed of individual projects that reduce fuel loads in
strategic locations. This fuel treatment network improves public and first responder safety and decreases
negative impacts of wildfires. The Thomas fire highlighted the effectiveness of the fuel treatment network
and provided an opportunity to expand the program to increase the buffer between wildland areas to the
north and the built environment within Montecito.

The California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (CAL FIRE) completed a programmatic
Environmental Impact Report (PEIR) for their Vegetation Treatment Program (CalVTP) in 2019. This PEIR
provided a process for MFPD to complete the required CEQA documentation for the expanded Vegetation
Management Program using the Project-Specific Analysis Checklist. Consistent with CEQA Guidelines
Section 151168(c)(2), if the potential environmental impacts of a proposed vegetation treatment project
are determined to be covered by the environmental impacts analyzed in the PEIR, the project may be
approved using a finding that the project is within the scope of the PEIR. The PEIR identified the range of
environmental impacts associated with the treatments and requires implementation of standard project
requirements and mitigation measures to address and minimize these impacts.

A Dudek team of CEQA experts, biologists, geologists, hydrologists, foresters, and cultural specialists
completed the analysis included in the PSA/Addendum and found Montecito’s Vegetation Management
Program within the scope of the CalVTP PEIR. The determination was made that no additional impacts
would occur as a result of the projects and no additional CEQA documentation is required.

Conclusion

Staff recommends that the Board of Directors approve Resolution 2022-17 approving the Montecito
Vegetation Management Program and finding the program is within the scope of the California
Department of Forestry and Fire Protection Vegetation Treatment Program Environmental Impact Report
and that no further CEQA documentation is required.

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 6

Attachments

1. Resolution 2022-17
2. Montecito Vegetation Management Program, Project Specific Analysis/Addendum

Strategic Plan Reference

Strategic Plan Goal #2, Enhance risk mitigation efforts

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 7

RESOLUTION NO. 2022-17

RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE
MONTECITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT APPROVING THE MONTECITO
VEGETATION MANAGEMENT PROGRAM AND FINDING THE PROGRAM IS WITHIN
THE SCOPE OF THE CALIFORNIA DEPARTMENT OF FORESTRY AND FIRE
PROTECTION VEGETATION TREATMENT PROGRAM ENVIRONMENTAL IMPACT
REPORT AND THAT NO FURTHER CEQA DOCUMENTATION IS REQUIRED

WHEREAS, the Montecito Fire Protection District (“Fire District”) is a fire
protection district duly organized and existing pursuant to the Fire Protection
District Law of 1987 codified in California Health & Safety Code Section 13800 et
seq.; and

WHEREAS, the Fire District proposes to implement the Montecito Vegetation
Management Program over a 10-year timeframe, consisting of the removal of
vegetation and dead trees with chainsaws, chipping of cut and/or dead vegetation
with chippers, roadside weed abatement with weed whips, hand removal of invasive
plants, and prescribed herbivory throughout the wildland urban interface and along
roads in the community of Montecito (the “Program”); and

WHEREAS, the Fire District is the lead agency for the Program under the
California Environmental Quality Act, California Public Resources Code Sections
21000 et seq. (“CEQA”), and CEQA Guidelines, California Code of Regulations, Title
14, Sections 15000 et seq. (“CEQA Guidelines”), and must comply with CEQA prior to
implementing the Program; and

WHEREAS, in 2019 the California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection
(“CAL FIRE”) completed a Program Environmental Impact Report (“PEIR”) for its
Vegetation Treatment Program (“CalVTP”), which document functions as a program
environmental impact report in accordance with CEQA Guidelines Section 15168 for
purposes of streamlining of CEQA review of later local agency activities consistent
with the CalVTP; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to the Project Specific Analysis/Addendum for the
Program, attached hereto as Exhibit “A” and incorporated herein by this reference
(“Addendum”), the Fire District has evaluated the Program using the Project-Specific
Analysis Checklist in the PEIR and, consistent with CEQA Guidelines Sections 15162—
15164 and 15168, has determined that the potential environmental impacts of the
Program are covered by the environmental impacts analyzed in the PEIR, and
therefore the Program is within the scope of the PEIR and no further CEQA review is
required.

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 8

NOW, THEREFORE, the Board of Directors of the Montecito Fire Protection
District does hereby resolve as follows:

1. Determination of No Further CEQA Review. The Board, having independently
considered the Addendum and the PEIR, finds that the potential
environmental impacts of the Program are covered by the environmental
impacts analyzed in the PEIR, and therefore the Program is within the scope
of the PEIR and no further CEQA review is required.

2. Adoption and Submittal of Addendum. The Addendum attached hereto as
Exhibit “A” is hereby adopted, and the Fire Chief or designee is instructed to
execute and submit to CAL FIRE the Addendum, and any other necessary
documents, within the timeframe set forth therein.

3. Notice of Determination. The Fire Chief or designee is instructed file and/or
record a Notice of Determination with any and all appropriate public
agencies or entities in accordance with CEQA.

4. Program Approval. The Board approves the Program.

PASSED AND ADOPTED, by the Board of Directors the Montecito Fire Protection
District this 24th day of October, 2022, by the following vote, to wit:

AYES:
NAYS:

ABSTAIN:
ABSENT:

Michael Lee, President

ATTEST:

Judith Ishkanian, Secretary

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 9

Exhibit A
Addendum

(See attached)

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 10

October 24, 2022



Agenda
Item #3

22222222222222



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 12

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 13

STAFF REPORT

Prepared for: Montecito Fire Protection District Board of Directors
From: Kevin Taylor, Fire Chief (¥

Prepared by: Aaron Briner, Fire Marshal

Date: October 24, 2022

Topic: 2022 California Fire Code Amendments and Adoption
Summary

The 2022 California Fire Code has been modified since the last code adoption cycle for a number
of reasons. Some sections have been edited by the International Code Committee and the various
California Code committees for greater clarity as to the applicability and intent of the code. Codes
are modified to take into account improvements in industry practices and procedures and to
provide consistency with revisions in state and federal law.

Background

The 2019 California Fire Code will be superseded by the 2022 version and will become State law
onJanuary 1%, 2023. The District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments, creating
the Montecito Fire Protection District Fire Code.

The substantive changes to the California Fire Code have been incorporated for consistency with
the State Fire Marshal’s Office. District Counsel and neighboring fire jurisdictions provided input.

Model Code — International Fire Code

Compiled from industry standards and recognized good practice with input from other
regulatory agencies.

State Code — California Code of Regulations

A model code that has been adopted and amended to address conditions specific to California.

Local Code — Montecito Fire Protection District Code

California code that has been amended to address Geologic, Topographic, or Climatic
conditions specific to Montecito Fire Protection District

October 24, 2022



Discussion

Reg. Mtg. Pg. 14

Montecito Fire Protection District has made amendments to the California Fire Code, California
Residential Code, and California Building Code to address local Geologic, Topographic, or Climatic
conditions. Items identified in red indicate an addition or change from the currently adopted

ordinance.

Montecito Amendments to the California Fire Code

Chapter 1 - Scope & Administration

Section

Description

Classification

101.1 Title

Necessary to identify the District as the authority,
having jurisdiction

Amendment

103.1 General

The Fire Prevention Bureau is established under
the direction of the Fire Code Official. Updated
the title to align with CFC.

Amendment

103.2 Appointment

The Fire Code Official is appointed by the Fire
Chief

Amendment

103.3 Deputies

The Fire Code Official may recommend to the
Board the employment of technical inspectors

Amendment

105.5.34 Open Burning

Expands definition of open burning and limits
exception to private property. Numbering was
updated due to re-organization of model code.

Amendment

105.5.54 Additional
Permits

Subsection 4 is added to require a permit for any
activity that the Fire Chief deems to produce
conditions hazardous to life or property that is
not explicitly identified in Chapter 1. Numbering
was updated due to re-organization of model
code.

Addition

111 Means of Appeals

Board of Appeals is deleted. Article 7 addresses
the District appeals process. Numbering and title
was updated due to re-organization and updates
of model code.

Deletion

112.5 Violations

Section added to address cost recovery for
repetitive false alarm responses. Numbering was
updated due to re-organization of model code.

Addition

October 24, 2022




Reg. Mtg. Pg. 15

Chapter 2 - General Definitions

Section Description Classification
Definitions were added to provide clarity to the
o use of the term in the ordinance. Some .
202 General Definitions o o Addition
definitions were moved to specific chapters to
facilitate ease of use.
o Definitions were amended to provide clarity to
202 General Definitions ] ) Amendment
the use of the term in the ordinance
Chapter 3 - General Requirements
Section Description Classification
. Expanded the types of open burning that are
307.1.1 Prohibited Open o ] ) :
Burni prohibited to include recreational fires and Amendment
urnin
& portable outdoor fireplaces
Expanded the types of open burning that fall
307.3 Extinguishment within the extinguishment authority of the Fire
, o , , , Amendment
Authority Code official to include recreational fires and
portable outdoor fireplaces
311.1.3 Buildings or Requires the owner of property to secure and
property damaged by fire| remove debris from property in a manner and Addition
or disaster time frame established by the Fire Code Official.
311.1.4 Authority to , , . -
Gives authority to Fire Code Official to secure
secure property , o
_ and remove debris from property when a Addition
damaged by fire or .
_ property owner fails to do so
other disaster
Chapter 5 - Fire Service Features
Section Description Classification
_ Added reference to the District’s Access .
503.1 Where required Addition

Development Standard

October 24, 2022




Reg. Mtg. Pg. 16

503.1.1 Buildings and

Removed the exception to increase the 150’

faciliti access requirement where not more than two Deletion
acilities
Group R-3 or Group U occupancies.
Added language that allows the Fire Code
Official to evaluate access road design in terms
503.1.4 Access road o .
desi of total response efficiency and make Addition
esign
& modifications accordingly. Added reference to
the District’s Access Development Standard
Added gate features including required width,
set-back, battery backup and Knox key .
503.6.1 Gate features ) _ Addition
requirements that had previously only been
identified in the Development Standards.
Added clarifying verbiage including a section
505.1 Address ) . . . . .
, o identifying which residential structures require | Amended
identification _
addressing
505.1.1 Mixed-use Requires clear notification of a mixed-use .
o o Addition
building building.
_ Requires a directory or premise map for .
505.1.2 Directory o Addition
complexes and large buildings.
, Added language allowing a key switch in addition
506.1 Where required Amended
to a key box
Chapter 6 - Building Services & Systems
Section Description Classification
Added language for signage related to
603.11 Signage for & .g gnag _
, permanently installed generators. This .
electrical generators or _ Addition
amendment was moved to Section 12-
other power sources
1203.1.3.1
Chapter 9 - Fire Protection & Life Safety Systems
Section Description Classification
901.6 Inspection, testing | Added language requiring approval from the Fire
Amendment

and maintenance

Code Official prior to removing any fire

October 24, 2022




Reg. Mtg. Pg. 17

protection systems and equipment. Added
language referencing section 901.8 for the
removal of the system.

901.11 Working space

Added language requiring a minimum working

) ] ) ) Addition
and clearance distance around fire protection equipment
Added language to capture concurrent permits
903.1.2 Concurrent in the calculation of total additions or Additi
ition
Permits modifications when determining the
requirement for automatic sprinkler installation
Added language to reference the addition of
, Section 903.7 and 1103.5 in the adopted
903.2 Where required , , Amended
ordinance. Numbering was updated due to re-
organization of model code.
Added language removing the exception for any
903.2.18 Exception alteration that creates a habitable space. Amended
Removed garages from exception.
903.7 Montecito Fire ) _ _ )
_ o Added section for design and installation of
Protection District L _ L o
o ) automatic fire sprinkler systems within the Addition
Automatic Fire Sprinkler o
District
Systems
Language stating that section 903.7 applies to all
o occupancies except townhouses and one and »
903.7.1 Application ] ] , Addition
two-family dwellings, which are governed by the
California Residential Code
Identifies which buildings are required to install
automatic sprinkler systems and the
903.7.2 Locations methodology for determining the requirement. Addit
ition
required Added an exception for detached Group U
buildings on a case-by-case basis. Reduced
aggregate alteration from 1,500 to 1,000 sf.
, Added language to ensure that a fire alarm
907.2.30 Mixed-use , _ _ . -
installed in a mixed-use occupancy notifies all Addition

occupancies

occupants

October 24, 2022




Reg. Mtg. Pg. 18

Chapter 11 - Fire Safety Requirements for Existing Buildings

Section Description Classification
1103.5 Sorinkler Svst Added language referencing the addition of A 4 ;
. rinkler Systems mendmen
P Y Section 903.2 in the District Ordinance
Chapter 12 - Energy Systems
Section Description Classification
1203.1.3.1 Signage for Added to require signage for permanently
electrical generators or | installed power sources that may back-feed Addition
other power sources electrical panels. Moved from Section 604.12.
1205.2.1.2 Set Backs at | Added language related to solar array ridge
. . . , , Amendment
Ridge setbacks in unsprinklered residential structures
) ) Deleted this section as the updated Chapter 12
1206.2.8.8 Residential _ _ . .
addresses the installation of fire protection Addition

garage installations

systems related to energy storage systems

Chapter 49 - Requirements for Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Areas

Section Description Classification
Update language necessary to identify the Fire

4901.1 Scope District’s requirements for local provisions Amendment
applicable in the WUI areas
Added new definitions to support amendments

4902 Definitions in this ordinance and relocated existing Amendment
definitions as they apply to Chapter 49.
Added language to identify when fire protection

4903.1 General i o o Amendment
plans are required within the District.
Added language to identify local requirements in

4903.2 Contents the Montecito Fire Code and Development Amendment
Standards for the fire protection plans.

4903.2.1.2 Final fire Added language to identify local requirements

Amendment

protection plan

for the fire protection plans.

October 24, 2022




Reg. Mtg. Pg. 19

4905.4 Fencing

The purpose is to address items exposing
buildings to increased ignition in the WUI area in
anticipation of guidance provided by the State
Board of Forestry regarding Zone 0. This
requirement is backed by case studies of
wildland fires over the past 5 years, and recent
research and testing conduct by The National
Institute of Standards and Technology (NIST), a
physical sciences laboratory and non-regulatory
agency of the United States Department of
Commerce. The use of ignition-resistance
fencing is also identified as an approved
mitigation measure in California Code of
Regulations, Title 14, Division 1, State Minimum
Fire Safe Regulations, Section 1276.01, when the
required 30-foot building setback to property
line cannot be provided in FHSZs. This
amendment also is in line with and supported by
findings in sections 1.1 and 4912 by improving
and hardening the developed communities in
the WUI area and reducing the impact of fires to
life and property in the developed communities.

Amendment

4906 Vegetation
Management
requirements for new
landscaping

Added language to identify local requirements
for new landscaping. The deletions in Section
4906.4 were made as these requirements for
vegetation (shrubs, trees, etc.) currently exist in
the Districts Standards for defensible space.

Amendment

4907 Defensible Space

Added language to identify local requirements
for defensible space, and incorporated language
previously only included in the Vegetation
Management Development Standard.

Amendment

4907.2 Application

Added language to include other land and LRA
designated High Fire Hazard Area.

Amendment

4907.3 Application

Added language to include PRC 4290, and the
District Vegetation Management Development
Standard.

Amendment

4907.4 Correction of
Condition

Added language giving Fire Code Official right to
notice and subsequently perform abatement of
violations.

Amendment

October 24, 2022




Reg. Mtg. Pg. 20

4907.5 Roadway

Added to match the current Vegetation

Fireworks

storage, sale, and use of fireworks in the District.

) Amendment
Vegetation Clearance Management Development Standard.
. Prohibits dumping waste material in the WUI, or
4907.6 Dumping . Amendment
hazardous fire areas
4907.7 Fire Hazard Allows Fire Code Official to require removal of
N _ _ Amendment
Determination any vegetation deemed to be a fire hazard
Provides for reasonable alternative measures
4907.8 Alternative when clearance of vegetation is impractical due
_ _ Amendment
Measures to terrain, danger of erosion or unusual
circumstances.
, Adds language stating that motor vehicles shall
4907.9 Use of Fire Roads ]
, not be parked in a manner that obstructs the Amendment
and Defensible Space ] )
entrance to a fire road or Defensible Space.
Chapter 56 - Explosives & Fireworks
5608.2 Prohibition of Added this section to prohibit all possession, .
Addition

Montecito Amendments to the California Residential Code

Chapter 13 — Building Planning

R313 Automatic Fire
Sprinkler Systems

Deleted and replaced the automatic sprinkler
section in the Residential Code related to
townhomes and single family residences to
match the amendment made in California Fire
Code Section 903. Reduced aggregate alteration
from 1,500 to 1,000 square feet to match CFC
Section 903. Included exception for small
bathrooms and closets in alignment with NFPA
13D.

Deletion/Amendment

October 24, 2022




Reg. Mtg. Pg. 21

Montecito Amendments to the California Building Code

Chapter 15 — Roof Assemblies & Rooftop Structures

Amended language for roof assembly
requirements within the District. Excluded the
use of treated wood shake/shingles even if they

meet Class A assembly standards. Reduced the

1505 Fire Classification Amendment

requirement to comply with the standard for
roof repair from max of 25% to 10%. Eliminated
the exception for detached structures less than
500 sf.

Adopted California Fire Code Appendices

Chapter 4 Special Detailed Requirements Based On Use and Occupancy
Appendix B Fire flow requirements for buildings
Appendix BB Fire flow requirements for buildings
Appendix C Fire Hydrant Spacing
Appendix CC Fire Hydrant Spacing
Appendix E Hazard Categories
Appendix F Hazard Ranking
Appendix G Cryogenic Fluids — Weight and Volume Equivalents

Appendix H Hazardous Materials Management Plans
Appendix | Fire Protection Systems — Noncompliant Conditions
Appendix K Construction Requirements for Existing Ambulatory Care Facilities
Appendix N Indoor Trade Shows and Exhibitions
Appendix O Temporary Haunted Houses, Ghost Walks and Similar Amusement Uses
Conclusion

Staff recommends the Board approve the first reading by title only of Ordinance No. 2022-01 of
the Montecito Fire Protection District adopting the 2022 California Fire Code and the Montecito
Fire Protection District Development Standards, amending provisions of the 2022 California Fire
Code, amending provisions of the 2022 California Residential Code, amending provisions of the
2022 California Building Code and scheduling a public hearing on November 28, 2022, for the
subsequent adoption of the ordinance.

Strategic Plan Reference

Goal #1 Deliver exceptional emergency services to our community

Goal #2 Enhance risk mitigation efforts
October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 22

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 23

ORDINANCE NO. 2022-01

AN ORDINANCE OF THE GOVERNING BOARD OF THE MONTECITO FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICT ADOPTING BY REFERENCE AND AMENDING THE 2022
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AND APPENDIX CHAPTERS AND APPENDIX
STANDARDS PRESCRIBING REGULATIONS GOVERNING CONDITIONS
HAZARDOUS TO LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE, HAZARDOUS MATERIALS
OR EXPLOSION; ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE MONTECITO FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICT DEVELOPMENT STANDARDS; PROVIDING FOR THE
ISSUANCE OF PERMITS FOR HAZARDOUS USES OR OPERATIONS;
ESTABLISHING A BUREAU OF FIRE PREVENTION AND PROVIDING OFFICERS
THEREFORE AND DEFINING THEIR POWERS AND DUTIES WITHIN THE
DISTRICT; AMENDING SECTION R313 OF THE 2022 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL
CODE; AMENDING SECTION 1505 OF THE 2022 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE;
AND REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 2019-02.

WHEREAS, the Montecito Fire Protection District operates under the provisions of
California’s Fire Protection District Law of 1987, wherein the State Legislature declared that the
local provision of fire protection services, rescue services, emergency medical services, hazardous
material emergency response services and other services relating to the protection of lives and
property is critical to the public peace, health and safety of the State of California and that local
control over the types, levels and availability of these services is a long-standing tradition in
California; and

WHEREAS, the State Legislature has also declared that its intent is to provide broad
statutory authority for local fire protection districts, encouraging local officials to adopt powers
and procedures set forth in the Fire Protection District Law of 1987 to meet their own
circumstances and responsibilities; and

WHEREAS, Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 expressly authorizes the Montecito
Fire Protection District to adopt building standards relating to fire and panic safety that are more
stringent than those building standards contained in the California Fire Code and other California
Building Standards Code.

NOW THEREFORE, the Governing Board of the MONTECITO FIRE PROTECTION
DISTRICT ordains as follows:

Article 1. Repeal of Previous Ordinances.

Ordinance No. 2019-02 of the Montecito Fire Protection District is hereby repealed.

Article 2. Adoption of California Fire Code.

The Board of Directors (“Board”) of the Montecito Fire Protection District (“District”), for the
purpose of prescribing regulations of governing conditions dangerous to life and property from
fire, hazardous materials or explosion, adopts by reference and incorporation, the 2021
International Fire Code and Part 9 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, known as the

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 24

California Fire Code 2022 Edition (*“CFC”), and the Montecito Fire Protection District
Development Standards, as the same may be amended from time-to-time (the “Development
Standards”), hereinafter collectively known as the Fire Code of the Montecito Fire Protection
District (“Code”). Adoption of the CFC includes Chapters 1-80, Appendix Chapter 4, and
Appendices B, BB, C, CC, E, F, G, H, I, K, N, and O as published by the International Code
Council, Inc., including necessary California amendments, save and except such portions as are
hereinafter amended, deleted, or added by this Ordinance. In the event of an inconsistency or
conflict between the provisions and standards set forth in the Code, the more restrictive provision
shall apply. The Development Standards are intended to establish regulations governing
conditions dangerous to life and property from fire, and to supplement the District’s adoption of
and amendments to the CFC, the California Residential Code, and the California Building Code
herein. Copies of the CFC and the Development Standards, certified to be true copies by the Clerk
of the Board, have been and are now filed in the office of the Clerk of the Board and the same are
hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set out at length herein. From the date on which
this Ordinance shall take effect, the provision thereof shall be controlling within the limits of the
territory of the District.

Article 3. Construction of terms.

The following terms in the California Fire Code shall be construed as indicated:
(@) “Jurisdiction” shall mean the territory of the District.
(b) “Fire Code Official” shall mean “Fire Marshal.”

(d) “Building Department” shall mean the Santa Barbara County Department of Planning
& Development.

(e) “County” shall mean the County of Santa Barbara.

(F) “Chief of Police” shall mean the Sheriff of the County of Santa Barbara or his/her
designee.

(g) “Police officer” shall mean Sheriff’s deputy.

(h) “Mixed-use building” shall mean any building or structure that includes both
residential dwelling unit(s) and non-residential unit(s).

Article 4. Amendments Made in the California Fire Code.

The California Fire Code is amended and changed in the following respects:
CHAPTER 1-SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

SECTION 101 - SCOPE AND GENERAL REQUIREMENTS

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 25

Section 101.1 “Title” is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the Montecito
Fire Protection District, hereinafter referred to as “the Code”.

SECTION 103 - CODE COMPLIANCE AGENCY
Section 103.1 “Creation of agency” is amended to read as follows:

103.1 General. The Fire Prevention Bureau (“Bureau”) is established in the
jurisdiction of the District under the Fire Code Official. The function of the Bureau
shall be the implementation, administration and enforcement of the provisions of
the Code.

Section 103.2 “Appointment” is amended to read as follows:

103.2 Appointment. A Fire Code Official to be in charge of the Bureau shall be
appointed by the Fire Chief on the basis of an examination to determine
qualifications.

Section 103.3 “Deputies” is amended to read as follows:

103.3 Deputies. The Fire Chief may recommend to the Board the employment of
an assistant fire code official, other related technical officers, inspectors and other
employees, who shall be selected in accordance with the prescribed procedures of
the District to determine their fitness for the position. The examination shall be
open to members and nonmembers of the District at the discretion of the Fire Code
Official.

SECTION 105 - PERMITS
Section 105.5.34 “Open Burning” is amended to read as follows:
105.5.34 Open Burning. An operational permit is required for the kindling or
maintaining of an open fire, open burning, recreational fire, portable outdoor
fireplace, or a fire on any public street, alley, road, or other public or private
ground. Instructions and stipulations of the permit shall be adhered to.
Exception: Recreational fires and portable outdoor fireplaces on private property.

Subsection (4) is added to Section 105.5.54 “Additional Permits” as follows:

4. General use permit. A general use permit for any activity or operation not
specifically addressed in this article, which in the judgment of the Fire Chief or
his/her designee could reasonably be expected to produce conditions hazardous
to life or property.

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 26

SECTION 111- MEANS OF APPEALS
Section 111 “Means of Appeals” is deleted.
SECTION 112 - VIOLATIONS
Section 112.5 is added to read as follows:
112.5.1 False alarms. The Fire Code Official is authorized to seek cost recovery
for a fire department response to an alarm system activation which is determined to
be a false alarm caused by system malfunction, system misuse, or other non-

emergency causes.

112.5.2 False alarm frequency. The cost recovery penalty fee may be charged for
all responses after the third false alarm in a calendar year

112.5.3 False alarm fee. The amount of the cost recovery penalty fee will be in

accordance with Article 9 of this Code. Additional fees may be charged for
extraordinary circumstances.

CHAPTER 2 - DEFINITIONS
SECTION 202 - GENERAL DEFINITIONS
Section 202 “General Definitions” is amended to include the following definitions:
ADDITION. Any construction change to an existing structure that includes, but is
not limited to, the addition of walls outside of the existing building envelope which
increases the existing square footage of the building.
BREEZEWAY. A roofed open passage connecting two buildings.
COMBUSTIBLE FENCING. See Chapter 49.
COMBUSTIBLE MATERIAL. See Chapter 49.
DEFENSIBLE SPACE. See Chapter 49.
FIRE AND LIFE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will
increase, or may cause an increase of, the hazard or menace of fire or a hazardous
material release (spill, leak, etc.) to a greater degree than customarily recognized as
normal by persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or extinguishing
fire and responding to hazardous material releases; or which may obstruct, delay,

hinder or interfere with the operations of the fire department or the egress from a
facility or building, or may become the cause of obstruction, delay or hindrance to

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 27

the prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of a fire or hazardous material
release.

FIRE HAZARD SEVERITY ZONE. See Chapter 49.

FIRE PROTECTION CERTIFICATE (FPC). The application for review by the
Bureau of any construction of new buildings or structures, or additions or
alterations to existing buildings or structures for which applications for building
permits are filed or are required to be filed with the County of Santa Barbara.
FUEL BREAK. See Chapter 49.

FUEL MODIFICATION. See Chapter 49.

HIGH FIRE HAZARD AREA. See Chapter 49.

HORIZONTAL PROJECTION. Any roofed projection intended for shelter or
occupancy and constructed as a roof assembly or floor/ceiling assembly above.
Horizontal Projection may include awnings, canopies, marquees, patio covers,
covered porches, balconies, eaves, eave overhangs, roofed overhangs, breezeways,
covered decks, etc.

LADDER FUELS. See Chapter 49.

ORNAMENTAL LANDSCAPE. See Chapter 49.

PARCEL. See Chapter 49.

PUBLIC NUISANCE. A declaration by the Fire Code Official that the presence of
Combustible Material or other conditions on a parcel creates a fire hazard.

STRUCTURE. That which is built or constructed, an edifice or building of any
kind, or any piece of work artificially built up or composed of parts joined together
in some definite manner.

TEMPORARY USE. Unless otherwise specified within this Code, Temporary
Use, when allowed, shall not exceed a period of 180 days in a 12-month period.

VEGETATION. See Chapter 49.
WILDFIRE EXPOSURE. See Chapter 49.

WILDFIRE RISK AREA (WRA). See Chapter 49.

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 28

Section 202 “General Definitions” is amended to include the following amended
definitions:

AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEM. An automatic fire sprinkler system, for
fire protection purposes, is an integrated system of underground and overhead
piping designed and installed in accordance with fire protection engineering
standards (reference standards) as may from time to time be adopted by the District.
The system shall include one or more automatic water supplies. The portion of the
system above the ground is a network of specially sized or hydraulically designed
piping installed in a structure or area, generally overhead, and to which automatic
sprinklers are connected in a systematic pattern. The system is usually activated by
heat from a fire and discharges water over the fire area. The reference standards
may include:

(a) Standard Nos. 13, 13D, 13R, and 24 as developed and published by
the National Fire Protection Association; and

(b) California Fire Code as developed and published by the
International Code Council, Inc. and the California Buildings
Standards Commission; and

(c) The Montecito Fire Protection District Development Standards as
may be amended from time to time.

FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD. A roadway that provides fire apparatus
access from a fire station or other staging area to a facility, building or portion
thereof. This is a general term inclusive of all other terms such as fire lane, public
street, private street, parking lot lane and access roadway and driveway. This
roadway may provide ingress and egress for both the fire department and the
general public during emergency events and normal use.

FIRE CODE OFFICIAL. The Fire Prevention Bureau Chief (Fire Marshal), as
appointed by the Fire Chief of Montecito Fire Protection District, charged with the
implementation, administration and enforcement of the Code, or a duly authorized
representative.

WILDFIRE RISK AREA (WRA) See Chapter 49.

CHAPTER 3 - GENERAL REQUIREMENTS

SECTION 307 - OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES & PORTABLE OUTDOOR
FIREPLACES

Section 307.1.1 “Prohibited open burning” is amended to read as follows:

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 29

307.1.1 Prohibited open burning. The Fire Code Official is authorized to prohibit
open burning, recreational fires, and the use of portable outdoor fireplaces when
atmospheric conditions or other circumstances make such fires hazardous. The
burning of rubbish (trash) is prohibited.

Exception: Prescribed burning for the purpose of reducing the impact of
wildland fire when authorized by the Fire Code Official.

Section 307.3 “Extinguishment authority” is amended to read as follows:

307.3 Extinguishment authority. When open burning, recreational fires, or the
use of portable outdoor fireplaces creates or adds to a hazardous situation, is not in
compliance with the Code, or a required permit has not been obtained, the Fire
Code Official is authorized to prohibit the fire, extinguish or order the
extinguishment of the fire.

SECTION 311 - VACANT PREMISES

Section 311.1.3 “Buildings or property damaged by fire or disaster” is added to read as
follows:

311.1.3 Buildings or property damaged by fire or disaster. The owner,
occupant, or other person having under their control any property or materials on
property damaged by fire or other disaster, when access by the public is possible,
shall secure the property either by boarding up all openings, fencing, barricading,
or other appropriate measures as approved by the Fire Code Official. All debris,
and/or damaged materials shall be removed from the property in the manner and
within the time frame established by the Fire Code Official.

Section 311.1.4 “Authority to secure property damaged by fire or other disaster” is added
to read as follows:

311.1.4 Authority to secure property damaged by fire or other disaster. The
Fire Code Official shall be empowered to initiate necessary actions to secure
property damaged by fire or other disaster and/or remove and dispose of debris, and
other damaged materials when, after giving notice to the owner of record of the

property, the owner fails to secure the property and/or remove debris as ordered by
the Fire Code Official.

CHAPTER 5 - FIRE SERVICE FEATURES
SECTION 503 - FIRE SERVICE ACCESS ROADS

Section 503.1 “Where required” is amended to read as follows:

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 30

503.1 Where required. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided and
maintained in accordance with Sections 503.1.1 through 503.1.4, California Code
of Regulations Title 14, and the most current version of the District’s Fire
Apparatus Access Development Standard.

Section 503.1.1 “Buildings and facilities”, exception 1.3 is deleted.
Section 503.1.4 “Access road design” is added to read as follows:

503.1.4 Access road design. The Fire Code Official may evaluate fire apparatus
access road design in terms of total response efficiency. The Fire Code Official is
authorized to make modifications to access road network design, access road routes
and inter-connectivity with new or existing roads so that response efficiency is
maintained, consistent with California Code of Regulations Title 14 and the most
current version of the District’s Fire Apparatus Access Development Standard.

Section 503.6.1 “Gate features” is added to read as follows:

503.6.1 Gate features. For any structure or area that is secured by a gate limiting
access by vehicles, the opening for such gate shall have a minimum opening
clearance width of not less than the required access road width. In addition, all such
gates shall be equipped with auxiliary back-up power and a Fire District approved
key operated switch or box. All gates must be located at least 30 feet from the
improved public road right-of-way or edge of pavement, as determined by the Fire
Code Official or designee and shall open inward allowing a vehicle to stop in front
of the gate without obstructing traffic along the improved public road right-of-way,
consistent with California Code of Regulations Title 14, and the most current
version of the District’s Fire Apparatus Access Development Standard.

SECTION 505 - PREMISES IDENTIFICATION
Section 505.1 “Address identification” is amended to read as follows:

505.1 Address identification. Approved address numbers and letters must be
placed on all new and existing buildings and units in such a location as to be
plainly visible and legible from the street or road fronting such buildings and units.
Only new and existing residential structures that qualify as an approved dwelling
unit will be provided with address identification. Numbers and letters must be at
least four (4) inches in height for residential and six (6) inches in height for
commercial structures, and may not be located on doors or other areas that can be
obstructed from view. The numbers and letters must be in a color that contrasts
with their background. Where required by the fire code official, address
identification shall be provided in additional approved locations to facilitate
emergency response. Where access is by means of a private road and the building
cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or means
shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained.

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 31

Section 505.1.1 “Mixed-use building” is added to read as follows:

505.1.1 Mixed-use building. A notification system, which indicates the presence
of residential dwelling units in a mixed-use building, shall be installed in a manner
and location approved by the Fire Code Official.

Section 505.1.2 “Directory” is added to read as follows:

505.1.2 Directory. For complexes and large buildings, an approved directory,
premise map, and directional signs may be required by the Fire Code Official. The
scale, design, and location shall be approved by the Fire Code Official.

Section 506.1 “Where required” is amended to read as follows:

506.1 Where required. “When access to or within a structure or an area is unduly
difficult because of secured openings or where immediate access is necessary for
life saving or firefighting purposes, the Fire Code Official is authorized to require a
key box or switch to be installed in an approved, accessible location. The key box
or switch shall be of an approved type. The key box shall contain keys to gain
necessary access as required by the Fire Code Official. Key switches installed for
the purpose of overriding gate operators shall be wired such that gates remain open
upon activation by the District.”

CHAPTER 9 - FIRE PROTECTION AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS

SECTION 901 - GENERAL

Section 901.6 “Inspection, testing and maintenance” is amended to read as follows:

901.6 Inspection, testing and maintenance. Fire detection and alarm systems,
emergency alarm systems, gas detection systems, fire-extinguishing systems,
mechanical smoke exhaust systems and smoke and heat vents shall be maintained
in an operative condition at all times, and shall be replaced or repaired where
defective. Non-required fire protection systems and equipment shall be inspected,
tested and maintained or removed only after obtaining written permission from the
Fire Code Official and shall be removed in accordance with Section 901.8.

Section 901.11 “Working space and clearance” is added to read as follows:

901.11 Working space and clearance. A working space of not less than 30 inches
in width, 36 inches in depth and 78 inches in height shall be provided in front of the
fire protection equipment including, but not limited to: fire sprinkler control valves,
fire department connections, hose connections, risers, hood system manual pull
stations, fire alarm control panels, fire pumps, and specialized fire protection
storage tanks (dry chemical, foam, CO2, clean agent). Where the fire protection

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 32

equipment is wider than 30 inches, the working space shall not be less than the
width of the equipment. No storage of any materials shall be located within the
designated working space. Direct access to the working space shall be provided
from aisles or access roadways. Modifications to working space dimensions shall
be approved by the Fire Code Official.

SECTION 903 - AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS
Section 903.1.2 “Concurrent Permits” is added to read as follows:

903.1.2 Concurrent Permits. Additions or modifications where the application for
a building permit is submitted prior to the final inspection of any previously issued
building permit(s) shall require the installation of an automatic fire sprinkler system
throughout the entire structure when the area of the addition or modification of all
open permits combined with the new application exceed the exceptions listed under
Section 903.2.

Section 903.2 “Where required” is amended to read as follows:

903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings
and structures shall be provided in the locations described in Sections 903.2.1
through 903.2.21 and Section 903.7. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in
existing buildings and structures shall be provided in the locations described by
Section 903.7 and Section 1103.5 as amended.

Section 903.2.18 “Exception” is amended to read as follows:

Exception: An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required
when additions or alterations are made to existing carports that do not have an
automatic residential fire sprinkler system installed in accordance with this section.
NOTE: This exception shall not apply if the alteration or addition includes
modification such that a habitable space is created.

Section 903.7 “Montecito Fire Protection District Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems” is
added to read as follows:

903.7 Montecito Fire Protection District Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems.
Terminology used within this Section shall be as defined in the reference standards
identified in Section 202 as amended. The most current edition of these standards
shall be utilized at the time of building permit issuance in the design and
installation of any automatic fire sprinkler system required by this Section.

903.7.1 Application. This Section shall apply to all occupancies within the
District’s jurisdiction except for townhouses and one and two-family dwellings,

which occupancies are governed by the California Residential Code as amended by
the District.

10

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 33

903.7.2 Locations required. Notwithstanding any other requirement of the Code
of the County of Santa Barbara, and except as otherwise provided in this Section,
automatic fire sprinkler systems shall be installed and maintained in all occupancies
and locations set forth as follows:

1. Any new building for which applications for building permits are filed or
are required to be filed with the County of Santa Barbara regardless of
square footage shall require the installation of an automatic fire sprinkler
system throughout the entire building.

Exception: Other detached Group U buildings, as defined by the California
Building Code, may be exempted from Section 903.7 on a case-by- case
basis in writing by the Fire Code Official.

2. Existing buildings and structures as set forth below.

(@) Aggregate alterations and/or additions of 500 square feet or more to
existing non-residential buildings or structures for which applications
for building permits are filed or required to be filed with the County
of Santa Barbara shall require the installation of an automatic fire
sprinkler system throughout the entire non-residential building or
structure.

(b) Any existing residential buildings or structures for which an
application for building permits is filed or required to be filed with
the County of Santa Barbara that meets either of the following two
requirements shall be required to install automatic fire sprinkler
systems throughout the entire building or structure:

i. An aggregate alteration and/or addition that is greater than
50% of the existing square footage of the building or
structure floor area; or

ii.  An aggregate alteration and/or addition that is greater than
1,000 square feet in gross floor area.

(c) All existing buildings and structures for which applications for
building permits for alterations and/or additions are filed or are
required to be filed with the County of Santa Barbara, which are not
served by water supplies meeting District standards as adopted from
time to time shall require the installation of an automatic fire
sprinkler system throughout the entire building or structure. The term
water supply is more specifically defined in the District standards as
adopted from time to time.

11

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 34

(d) All existing buildings for which applications for building permits for
alterations and/or additions are filed or required to be filed with the
County of Santa Barbara, which are not located within three (3) miles
travel distance or a five (5) minute response time by fire apparatus
from a staffed District fire station shall require the installation of an
automatic fire sprinkler system throughout the entire building or
structure.

(e) Any change of occupancy in an existing building where the
occupancy changes to a higher hazard classification or as deemed
necessary by the Fire Code Official shall require the installation of an
automatic fire sprinkler system throughout the entire building.

SECTION 907 - FIRE ALARM AND DETECTION SYSTEMS
Section 907.2.30 “Mixed-use occupancies” is added to read as follows:
907.2.30 Mixed-use occupancies. In mixed-use occupancies, a fire alarm system
shall be installed which notifies all occupants in the event of a fire. The system

shall include a multiple-station smoke alarm and automatic smoke detection
throughout the commercial and common areas.

CHAPTER 11 - CONSTRUCTION REQUIREMENTS FOR
EXISTING BUILDINGS

SECTION 1103 - FIRE SAFETY REQUIREMENTS FOR EXISTING BUILDINGS
Section 1103.5 “Sprinkler systems” is amended to read as follows:
1103.5 Sprinkler systems. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in

existing buildings in accordance with Sections 1103.5.1 through 1103.5.4and
Section 903.2.

CHAPTER 12 - ENERGY SYSTEMS

SECTION 1203 - EMERGENCY AND STANDBY POWER SYSTEMS

Section 1203.1.3.1 “Signage for electrical generators or other power sources” is added to
read as follows:

1203.1.3.1 Signage for electrical generators or other power sources. Permanent
installations of electrical generators or other power sources may require approval
from the Fire Code Official. Permanent engraved and affixed signage reading
“Caution-Alternate Power Source” in 1” tall letters shall be permanently installed
on each electrical panel subject to back-feed from alternate power sources. Any and

12

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 35

all power disabling switches shall be clearly labeled. All provisions of the National
Electric Code, the Uniform Fuel Gas Code, the California Building Code, and this
Code shall be followed for any such installation.

SECTION 1205 - SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC POWER SYSTEMS

Section 1205.2.1.2 “Set Backs at Ridge” is amended to read as follows:

1205.2.1.2 Set Backs at Ridge. “Photovoltaic arrays installed on the roofs of
residential buildings shall be located only on one side of any ridge in order to allow
for District smoke and heat ventilation operations. The arrays shall be located no
less than 3 feet from the ridge.

Exceptions: Where photovoltaic arrays are placed on both sides of any ridge, the
photovoltaic arrays shall be spaced a minimum of 5 feet on one side and 3 feet on
the other side of the ridge.”

CHAPTER 49 - REQUIREMENTS FOR WILDLAND-URBAN
INTERFACE FIRE AREAS

SECTION 4901 - GENERAL
Section 4901.1 “Scope” is amended to read as follows:

4901.1 Scope. This chapter provides provisions intended to identify fire hazard
areas and contains minimum requirements to mitigate the risk to life and structures
from intrusion of fire from wildland fire exposures, fire exposures from adjacent
structures, and to mitigate fires from spreading from a structure to wildland fuels,
all of which may threaten to destroy life, overwhelm fire suppression capabilities,
or result in large property loss. Requirements are based upon the California Health
& Safety Code, California Public Resource Code (PRC), California Code of
Regulations, California Government Code and Montecito Fire District
requirements.

SECTION 4902 — DEFINITIONS

Section 4902 “Definitions” is amended to include the following definitions:

COMBUSTIBLE FENCING. Any fencing product or installation, including gates
within the fencing, that is not Ignition-Resistant Material.

COMBUSTIBLE MATERIAL. Includes seasonal and recurrent weeds, stubble,
brush, dry leaves, mulch, tumbleweeds, rubbish, recyclable material, litter or
flammable materials of any kind that are readily ignitable and endanger the public
safety.

13

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 36

DEFENSIBLE SPACE. An area either natural or man-made, where material
capable of allowing a fire to spread unchecked has been treated, cleared or
modified to slow the rate of intensity of an advancing wildfire or escaping structure
fire. The area is characterized by the establishment and maintenance of fuel
modification measures that creates an area for fire suppression operations to occur.

FUEL BREAK. An area, strategically located for fighting anticipated fires, where
the native vegetation has been modified or replaced so that fires burning into it can
be more easily controlled. Fuel Breaks divide fire-prone areas into smaller areas
for easier fire control and to provide access for firefighting.

FUEL MODIFICATION. A method of modifying fuel load by reducing the
amount of non fire-resistive vegetation or altering the type of vegetation to reduce
the fuel load.

HIGH FIRE HAZARD AREA. An area of the County of Santa Barbara
designated by the Building Official as having a high propensity for wildfire due to
the existence of excessive wild brush fuel, lack of adequate water for fire
suppression, or lack of adequate access to firefighting equipment and is shown on a
map entitled “High Fire Hazard Area Map” on file in the County of Santa Barbara
Building and Safety Division of the Planning and Development Department. This
area is to be considered a Wildland-Urban Interface Area.

LADDER FUELS. Vegetative fuels which provide vertical continuity, thereby
allowing fire to carry from surface fuels into the crowns of trees or shrubs with
relative ease.

ORNAMENTAL LANDSCAPE. All grasses, plants, trees and other vegetation
installed by a property owner. This is usually for aesthetic or privacy screening.

PARCEL. A portion of land of any size, the area of which is determined by the
assessor’s maps and records and may be identified by an assessor’s parcel number
whether or not any buildings are present.

VEGETATION. Means all plants, including trees, shrubs, grass, and perennial or
annual plants.

WILDFIRE EXPOSURE. One or a comhination of radiant heat, convective heat,
direct flame contact and burning embers being projected by vegetation fire to a
structure and its immediate environment.

WILDFIRE RISK AREA (WRA). Land which is covered with grass, grain,
brush, or forest, whether privately or publicly owned, which is so situated or is of
such inaccessible location that a fire originating upon such land would present an
abnormally difficult job of suppression or would result in great and unusual
damage through fire or resulting erosion or such areas designated by the Fire Code

14

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 37

Official. The Fire Code Official is authorized to utilize, as references, the
definition of Wildland-Urban Interface Area, State SRA maps, Local Agency Fire
Hazard Severity Zone Maps designated pursuant to California Government Code
Sections 51175 through 51189 and the Montecito Fire Protection District
Development Standards. Areas classified as a Wildfire Risk Area are designated as
a WUI area for purposes of this chapter.

Section 4902 “Definitions” is amended to include the following amended definitions:

FIRE HAZARD SEVERITY ZONES (FHSZ). Geographical areas designated
pursuant to California Resources Code Sections 4201 through 4204.1 and classified
as Very High, High, or Moderate in State Responsibility Areas (SRA) or
designated pursuant to California Government Code Sections 51175 through 51189
and classified as Very High, High, or Moderate in Local Responsibility Areas
(LRA).

The California Code of Regulations, Title 14, Section 1280 entitles the maps of these geographical
areas as “Maps of the Fire Hazard Severity Zones in the State Responsibility Area of California.”.

WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE FIRE AREA. A geographical area
identified by the state or local agency as a “Fire Hazard Severity Zone” in
accordance with the Public Resources Code Sections 4201 through 4204.1, and
Government Code Sections 51175 through 51189, or other areas designated by the
enforcing agency to be at a significant risk from wildfires, including Wildfire Risk
Areas.

SECTION 4903 - PLANS
Section 4903.1 “General” is amended to add the following:
A Fire Protection Plan (FPP) is required for all new construction projects in the
Montecito Fire Protection District High & Very High Fire Hazard Areas and may
also be required in other plan areas if deemed necessary by the Fire Code Official or
designee. The FPP must comply with this Chapter and Development Standard 2.

Exception: A single-family dwelling (Group R-3 Occupancy) when located on an
existing legal parcel.

Section 4903.2 “Contents” is amended to read as follows:
4903.2 Contents. The FPP shall be based on a project-specific wildfire hazard

assessment that includes considerations of location, topography, aspect, and
climatic and fire history.

15

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 38

The FPP shall identify conformance with all applicable state wildfire protection
regulations, statutes and applicable local ordinances, whichever are more
restrictive.

The FPP shall address fire department access, egress, road and address signage,
water supply, in addition to fuel reduction, in accordance with PRC 4290, this
Code, and Montecito Fire District Vegetation Management Development Standard,
as periodically amended; the defensible space requirements in accordance with
PRC 4291, Government Code 51182, and Sections 4906 and 4907 of this chapter;
and the applicable building codes and standards for wildfire safety. The FPP shall
identify mitigation measures to address the project’s specific wildfire risk and shall
include the information required in Section 4903.2.1 of this chapter.

The FPP must be submitted and approved by the District prior to the erection of
combustible materials. The FPP must describe all actions that will be taken to
prevent fire from being carried toward or away from structures. The requirements
of the FPP shall be applicable for the life of the project or development. The FPP
shall include:

a. A copy of the site plan that includes a landscape plan, property line
boundaries, and topographic reference lines.

b. The building envelope with all structures and improvements.

c. Designated Fuel Modification Zones in compliance with defensible space
standards.

d. Elements of the FPP shall include removal of dead vegetation, litter,
vegetation that may grow into overhead electrical lines; certain ground fuels,
and ladder fuels as well as the thinning of live trees.

Section 4903.2.1.2 “Final fire protection plan” is amended to add the following three
bullets in subsection 1:

d. Identification of existing vegetation proposed to remain.
e. Elements of the FPP shall include removal of slash, snags, vegetation that
may grow into overhead electrical lines, other ground fuels, ladder fuels and

dead trees, and the thinning of live trees.

f. Methods and timetables for controlling, changing, or modifying areas on the
property.

SECTION 4905 - WILDFIRE PROTECTION BUILDING CONSTRUCTION
Section 4905.4 “Fencing” is added to read as follows:

4905.4.1 Scope. This section only applies to fences, including gates within the
fencing, within 5 feet of building(s) that are in the WUI area.

16

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 39

4905.4.2 New fencing. New fencing and gates installed on or after January 1, 2023,
shall be of Ignition-Resistant Material.

4905.4.3 Existing fencing. Fencing installed prior to January 1, 2023, may remain.
Exception: The entire fencing not parallel and within 5 feet of the building,
including gates within the fencing, shall be Ignition-Resistant Material when any
portion of existing fencing within 5 feet is being replaced. Fencing beyond 5 feet
from the building is not required to be replaced with Ignition-Resistant Material.

SECTION 4906 - VEGETATION MANAGEMENT REQUIREMENTS FOR NEW
LANDSCAPING

Section 4906.2 “Application” is amended to read as follows:
4906.2 Application. All new plantings of vegetation in State Responsibility Areas
(SRA), Local Responsibility Areas (LRA) designated as a High or Very High Fire
Hazard Severity Zone, and WUI areas identified by the fire code official, shall
comply with Sections 4906.3 through 4906.4.

Section 4906.3.1 “Contents” subsection 1: is amended to read as follows:

1. Delineation of the 5-foot (Zone 0), 30-foot (Zone 1) and 100-foot (Zone 2) fuel
management zones from all structures.

Section 4906.4 “Vegetation” is amended to read as follows:
4906.4 Vegetation. All new vegetation shall be fire-resistant vegetation in
accordance with this section and the requirements of Vegetation Management

Standards as issued and approved by the Fire Code Official.

To be considered fire-resistant vegetation, it must meet at least one of the following
as approved by the Fire Code Official:

1. Be identified as fire-resistant vegetation in an approved book, journal or listing
from an approved organization.

2. Be identified as fire-resistant vegetation by a licensed landscape architect with
supporting justification.

3. Plants considered fire-resistant vegetation and approved by the local enforcing
agency.

Section 4906.4.1 “Shrubs” is deleted.

17

October 24, 2022



Reg. Mtg. Pg. 40

Section 4906.4.2 “Trees” is deleted.
SECTION 4907 - DEFENSIBLE SPACE
Section 4907.1 “General” is amended to read as follows:
4907.1 General. Vegetation and fuels shall be managed to reduce the severity of
potential exterior wildfire exposure to buildings and to reduce the risk of fire
spreading to buildings as required by applicable laws and regulations.

Section 4907.2 “Application” is amended to read as follows:

4907.2 Application. Buildings and structures located in the following areas shall
maintain the required defensible space:

1. All unincorporated lands designated by the State Board of Forestry and Fire
Protection as a State Responsibility Area (SRA).

2. Land designated as a Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone by the Director.

3. Land designated in ordinance by local agencies as a High or Very High Fire
Hazard Severity Zone pursuant to Government Code Section 51179.

4. Other land designated by the Fire Code Official.
Section 